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In conclusion

Primitive Christianity was characterized by its intolerance and
intransigence, and by considering itself as the only way of
salvation for all men on the planet. These characteristics were
inherited from Judaism, from which it came and which it
imitated.

Christianity shows, paradoxically, that to consider all human
beings equal is the worst form of intolerance: because it is
assumed as a dogma of faith that the same religion or moral is
valid and obligatory for all men, and therefore it is imposed, even
against their will. This aspect was renewed later with the other
great and virulent egalitarian doctrines: democracy and
communism.

The Aryans, accepting the difference of peoples, also accepted that
they worshiped gods other than their own and had different
customs; and they would never have thought of preaching their
religion or their morals outside of their town. It would have
seemed ridiculous to preach Odin’s worship among blacks, for
example; and it made no difference to them that the Semites
worshiped Molech.

The tactic of the old European was always to dominate through
military triumph, not to forcefully convert or manipulate
thoughts. The reaction of Christianity, on the other hand, was to
wipe out everything that could remind us our old beliefs and
traditions. Any medicinal knowledge of plants or animals was
branded as heresy and persecuted. In fact, any kind of knowledge
that was not Judeo-Christian was persecuted conscientiously.
Spiritual terror had made its appearance in Europe.

This is Christianity, and what came after: feints, collages,
palimpsests and mixtures of it with paganism in unstable
combinations that never finished curdling in the confused
European collective unconscious. In those days the schizophrenia
of the current West started: the debate between the heroic Greco-
Roman heritage or the humanist Judeo-Christian heritage.

The founders and the great conquerors had wanted their peoples
to triumph and be eternal on Earth. They did not achieve it in the
long term, and all disappeared. The Romans, then, went to swell
that macabre list. In the West, the future of millennia belonged to
the Germans, who established throughout Western Europe feudal
kingdoms where they rose as aristocracy.

I have listed facts that marked the end of Classical Antiquity with
all its wisdom, and the beginning of the Dark Ages. This age used
as a tool the Germans, but the Germans were not guilty. They only
gave the coup de grâce to a decadent monster—and it was
precisely the Germans who preserved Roman works of art from
Christian destruction when they seized power (consider the case of
King Theodoric).

The occultation would last in Europe until the time of Catharism;
of the Vikings and Crusades in the 11th century: when the
European knights discovered the tradition that the East had kept.
Some friars devoted themselves to collecting natural knowledge
such as medicine or botany. The Mesopotamian, Egyptian, Persian
and to some extent Greek and Hindu legacies were preserved by
the Islamic civilisation which, unlike Christianity, not only did not
destroy the pagan legacy, but kept it.

The resurgence of European spirituality came from the warrior
and chivalric castes. And the results, some cleaner than others,
were the Holy Roman-Germanic Empire, the Vikings, the Occitan
civilization, the Templars, the Italian Renaissance with its
fascination for the Greco-Roman world, and the Spanish empire.

There are those who get themselves into a mess with the ‘Christian
heritage’ of Europe. I do not. I see Europeans living with some
customs and their natural rites, beautiful and harmonious, which
automatically led to the most normal thing in the world, thus
taking part in that immense orchestra that is the Earth.

I see a fanatical creed preached by Semitic fundamentalists from
the East and Africa, who inflamed the spirits of the world’s scum
against the good people; against the native Europeans, against the
representatives of order and light. They said that our ancestral
customs were abominations. They said that those who practiced
them were sinners. They said that our science was demonic
sorcery, and our art, blasphemy.

They said that whoever did not kneel before a strange new oriental
god deserved the worst torments. They cursed the strong, the
nobles, the fighters, the pure, the philosophers and the wise, and
blessed the slaves, the sick, the trampled, the prostitutes, the
ignorant and the cowardly.

They destroyed the legacy that we had accumulated for centuries.
They killed our leaders. They put an end to an Empire that could
well, under Germanic influence, spread throughout the world.

They plunged Europe into ignorance and banned knowledge. For
centuries, they spread depression, guilt and the feeling of sin,
introducing into Europe that cancer that is the Old Testament,
and that castrating poison that is the New Testament.

If Europe could still thrive in these conditions, it was not thanks to
Christianity but in spite of it, and thanks to the things that
Christianity had not yet touched.

This piece is from a statue of the emperor Hadrian that should have
measured about five meters, and was found in Sagalassos, present south-

central Turkey, where Christianity took root early.

In short, Christianity was a subversive movement of agitation
against Rome, against Greece and, ultimately, against the
European world.

We have to assume that what has come down to us from the
Greco-Roman world is only a tiny part of what was really there,
and that it was taken away by the Judeo-Christian destruction.

Christianity, as a slave rebellion devised and led by Jews with the
aim of destroying Roman power—and, ultimately, all European
power—was and is a doctrine aimed at converting vigorous
peoples into domesticated flock of sheep.
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Judaea, victorious

416 CE: A famous Christian leader known as ‘Sword of God’
exterminates the last ‘pagans’ of Bithynia, Asia Minor. That year,
in Constantinople all public officials, army commanders and
judges who are not Christians are fired.

423 CE: The emperor decrees that ‘paganism’ is ‘a cult of the devil’
and orders that all those who continue to practice it be imprisoned
and tortured.

429 CE: The Athenians are persecuted, and the temple of the
goddess Athena—the famous Parthenon of the Acropolis—is
looted.

435 CE: In this year occurs the most significant action on the part
of Emperor Theodosius II: He openly proclaims that the only legal
religion in Rome apart from Christianity is Judaism!

Through a bizarre, subterranean and astonishing struggle,
Judaism has not only persecuted the old culture, and Rome, its
mortal archenemy, adopts a Jewish creed—but the Jewish religion
itself, so despised and insulted by the old Romans, is now elevated
as the only official religion of Rome along with Christianity!

We must recognise the conspiratorial astuteness and the
implacable permanence of objectives of the original Judeo-
Christian nucleus! What they did was literally turn the tables on
their favour: turn Rome into anti-Rome; put at the service of
Jewry everything that the Jews so hated; take advantage of the
strength of Rome and its state apparatus, to put Rome against
Rome itself in a sinister political- spiritual jiu-jitsu—from spitted
slaves, trampled, insulted, despised and looked down, to absolute
spiritual masters of the Roman Empire!

In a nutshell, Christianity was a subversive movement of agitation
against Rome, against Greece and, ultimately, against the
European world.

As already stated, we have to assume that what has come down to
us from the Greco-Roman world is only a tiny part of what was
really there and that it was taken away by the Judeo-Christian
destruction. Christianity, as a slave rebellion devised and led by
Jews with the aim of destroying Roman power—and, ultimately,
all European power—was and is a doctrine aimed at converting
vigorous peoples into a domesticated flock of sheep. Nietzsche
understood it perfectly, but when will we be able to fully assimilate
what this meant and what it still means today?

Read the whole Spanish-English translation: here!

 

Above, Laocoön and His Sons. The sculpture that once was in the
palace of Emperor Titus represents the tragic agony of the Ancient
World: Classic, athletic, wise, beautiful, courageous and close to
the gods, at the hands of the Eastern serpent.
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The martyrdom of Hypatia as an example of Christian terrorism

Alexandria, Egypt, year 415. The protagonist is Hypatia (370-
415), philosopher and mathematician instructed by her father, the
also famous philosopher and mathematician Theon of Alexandria.
Hypatia’s biographers say that in the morning she spent several
hours in physical exercise, and that afterwards she took relaxing
baths that helped her concentrate her mind to devote the rest of
the day to the study of philosophy, music and mathematics.

Hypatia was virgin and chaste; that is, she was at the level of a
priestess. She was, in short, a wise woman, ‘a perfect human
being’, just as her father had wanted. Hypatia also ran a
philosophical school from which women were excluded. (This is to
give thought to the feminists who have tried to ‘feminize’ the
figure of Hypatia in recent times.)

Hypatia, by Charles William
Mitchell.

The bigwig of Alexandria during that
time was Archbishop Cyril (370-444),
nephew of the aforementioned
Theophilus. He had the title of
patriarch, an ecclesiastical honour
that amounted almost to that of the
pope, and which was held only by the
archbishops of Jerusalem, Alexandria
and Constantinople: that is, the most
Jewish and Christian cities of the
Roman Empire. During this time
there was another mass rebellion;

once again, street fights, tensions and settling of scores between
Christians and Hellenists followed each other.

Archbishop Cyril had started a persecution of Alexandria scholars,
twenty-four years after the library fire. This time, more
radicalized, the Christians murdered anyone who refused to
convert to the new religion. Hypatia, at that time director of the
museum, where she dedicated herself to the philosophy of Plato,
was one of those people, for which she was accused of conspiring
against the archbishop.

Days after the accusation, friars called parabalani, fanatical
monks in charge of the ‘dirty work’ of the archbishop and coming
from the church of Jerusalem of St. Cyril,[1] kidnapped her from
her carriage, beat her, stripped her and dragged her throughout
the city, until they reached the church of Caesarea. There, at the
orders of a lector named Peter, they raped her several times and
then skinned her and ripped the flesh with sharp oyster shells.

Hypatia died raped, skinned and bleeding in atrocious pains. After
this, they dismembered her corpse, took her pieces through
Alexandria as trophies and then to a place called Cinarion, where
they were burned. The archbishop who ordered his martyrdom is
remembered by the Church as St. Cyril of Alexandria.

Only a crowd sick with resentment and hatred, and enraged by
commissaries expert in the art of raising slaves, could carry out
this act, which disgusts any person with a minimum of decency.
Hypatia was the perfect victim for a ritual sacrifice: European,
beautiful, healthy, wise, Hellenistic and virgin. And that is what
excites slaves the most when sacrificing the innocence and
kindness of the victim.

The cruelty shown, even in regard to the destruction of her corpse,
indicates that the Christians greatly feared Hypatia and all that
she represented. The death of the scientist, in addition to being
perfectly illustrative of the atrocities committed by Christians at
this time, inaugurated an era of persecution of Hellenistic priests
in North Africa, especially directed against the Egyptian
priesthood. Most of them were crucified or burned alive.

Hypatia’s atrocity is described here because it is well known; and
it is shocking that it happened to an unarmed, defenceless and
harmless woman, but let us not think of it as an isolated case.
Many simple Hellenists who did not look for trouble were
sacrificed in a similar or worse way, and would continue to be so
for many centuries.

_______________

[1] Note from the Ed.: Probably ethnic Semites.
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The destruction of the Greco-Roman World – 3

(Fifth century)

401
A crowd of Christians lynched the Hellenists in Carthage,
destroying temples and idols. In Gaza, the Hellenists are lynched
at the request of Bishop Porphyry, who also orders the destruction
of the nine temples still standing in the city. That same year, the
15th Council of Chalcedon commands the excommunication—even
after their deaths!—of Christians who keep good relationships
with their Hellenist relatives.

St. John Chrysostom, ‘Holy and Father of the Church’, raises
funds with the help of rich, boring, idle and resentful Christian
women against the patriarchal Roman worship of perfection and
war (such women are fascinated by the sickly Christian
sadomasochism). Thus financed, he carries out a work of
demolition of Greek temples. Thanks to John Chrysostom, the
ancient temple of Artemis in Ephesus is demolished.

The immense temple of Artemis in Ephesus was one of the Seven Wonders
of the Ancient World and had been built in the 6th century BCE over an

area considered sacred since, at least, the Bronze Age. Its construction took
120 years and it could be said that it was perfectly comparable to a

cathedral. The Christians end the existence of this
almost millennial building.

406-407
Emperor Arcadius returns to launch a decree in which he
prohibits all non-Christian cults, which means that at this point
so-called ‘paganism’ persists. A group of foederati tribes
(federated to Rome, residents within its borders and faithful
defenders of the empire), the Vandals, the Swabians and the Alans
(the latter of Iranian origin, not Germanic) invaded France,
destined for Spain.

408
Emperor Honorius of the Western Empire and Emperor Arcadius
of the Eastern Empire ordered together that all Greco-Roman
sculptures be destroyed. There are again destructions of temples,
massacres and fires of their writings. Around this time, the famous
African St. Augustine, Bishop of Hippo, ‘Saint, Father and Doctor
of the Church’ massacred hundreds of adepts of the old ways in
Calama, Algeria. (It will not be long before he died at the hands of
the Vandals, a Germanic people that doesn’t walk around
nonsense.) Augustine also established the persecution of judges
who show mercy to the ‘idolaters’.

This same year of 408 the emperor Arcadius dies, being succeeded
by the Emperor Theodosius II. To get an idea of the fanaticism,
dementia and moral quality of this abortive subhuman, suffice it
to say that he ordered children to be executed for playing with
pieces of destroyed Greco-Roman statues. According to the same
Christian historians, Theodosius II ‘meticulously followed the
Christian teachings’.

Emperor Theodosius II. Judging by the quality of the portrait, the
empire was not in good shape under his reign, or perhaps

it is that the old sculptors had been killed.

While all this takes place, this same year of 408 a Roman chief of
Germanic origin who had courageously defended the borders of
the empire, Stilicho the vandal, is executed by a party of decadent
Romans envious of his triumphs. After his unjust death, this party
gives a sort of coup d’état and the women and children—we are
talking about a minimum of 60,000 people—of the German
foederati are massacred throughout Italy by the Christians. After
this cowardly act the fathers and husbands of these families
(30,000 men who had been faithful soldiers of Rome) went over
the ranks of the Visigothic king Alaric, devastated with rage and
calling for revenge against the murderers.

409
The Roman Empire collapses in irremissibly crisis, in filthy
corruption and overwhelmed by the Germans. But the powerful
Christians are in a hurry to eradicate the Greco-Roman legacy
before the Germans discover it—lest the Germanised empire
becomes Greece-Rome II! That same year, Swabians, Vandals and
Alans cross the Pyrenees and invade Spain.

410
An army of Visigoths and other German allies loot Rome itself,
continuing later in the south of France, Spain and Africa. From
there, they try to dominate the Mediterranean.
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The destruction of the Greco-Roman World – 2

(Fourth century – Cont.)

372
Emperor Valentinian orders the governor of Asia Minor to
exterminate all the Hellenes (meaning as such the non-Christian
Greeks of ancient Hellenic lineage, i.e., the Aryans; and especially
the old Macedonian ruling caste) and destroy all documents
relating to their wisdom. In addition, the following year he again
prohibits all methods of divination.

It is around this time when Christians coined the contemptuous
term ‘pagan’ to designate the Gentiles, that is, all who are neither
Jews nor Christians. ‘Pagan’ is a word that comes from the Latin
pagani, which means villager. In the dirty, corrupt, decadent,
cosmopolitan and mongrelised cities of the now decadent Roman
empire, the population is essentially Christian but in the
countryside, the peasants, who keep their heritage and tradition
pure, are ‘pagans’. It is in the countryside, oblivious to
multiculturalism, where the ancestral memory is preserved. (Both
Christians and communists did their best to end the way of life of
the landowner, the farmer and the peasant.)

However, this peasant ‘paganism’, stripped of priestly leadership
and temples and finally plunged into persecution and
miscegenation, is doomed to eventually become a bundle of
popular superstitions mixed with pre-Indo-European roots,
although something of the traditional background will always
remain, as in the local ‘healers’ and ‘witches’ who for so long
subsisted despite the persecutions.

Ending classical culture was not so easy. It was not easy to find all
the temples or destroy them. Nor was it easy to identify all the
priests of the old religion, or those who practiced their rites in
secret. That was a long-term task for a zealous, meticulous and
fanatical elite of ‘commissaries’ that would last for many, many
generations: centuries and centuries of spiritual terror and intense
persecution.
 
375
The temple of the god Asclepius in Epidaurus, Greece is forcibly
closed.

378
The Romans are defeated by the Gothic army in the battle of
Hadrianopolis. The emperor intervenes and, through a sagacious
diplomacy, makes allies (foederati) of the Goths, a Germanic
people originally from Sweden: famous for their beauty, and who
had a kingdom in what is now Ukraine. Some time later, in 408,
after the fall of Stilicho (a general of Vandal origin who served
Rome faithfully but who was betrayed by a Christian and an
envious political mob), the women and children of these Germans
foederati will be massacred by the Romans, propitiating that the
men, prisoners of the rage, join en masse the German commander
Alaric.

380
Emperor Theodosius I (Theodosius the Great for Christianity)
decrees, through the edict of Thessalonica, that Christianity is
officially the only tolerable religion in the Roman Empire,
although this has been obvious for years. Theodosius calls non-
Christians ‘crazy’ as well as ‘disgusting, heretics, stupid and blind’.

Emperor Theodosius I

Bishop Ambrose of Milan starts a campaign to demolish the
temples in his area. In Eleusis, ancient Greek sanctuary, Christian
priests throw a hungry crowd, ignorant and fanatical against the
temple of the goddess Demeter. The priests are almost lynched by
the mob. Nestorius, a venerable old man of 95 years, announces
the end of the mysteries of Eleusis and foresees the submergence
of men in darkness for centuries.

381
Simple visits to the Hellenic temples are forbidden, and the
destruction of temples and library fires throughout the eastern
half of the empire continues. The sciences, technology, literature,
history and religion of the classical world are thus burned. In
Constantinople, the temple of the goddess Aphrodite is turned
into a brothel, and the temples of the god Helios and the goddess
Artemis are converted into stables! Theodosius persecutes and
closes the mysteries of Delphi, the most important of Greece,
which had so much influence on the history of ancient Greece.

382
The Jewish formula Hellelu-Yahweh or Hallelujah (‘Glory to
Yahweh’) is instituted in Christian Masses.

384
The emperor orders the praetor prefect Maternus Cynegius, uncle
of the emperor and one of the most powerful men of the empire, to
cooperate with the local bishops in the destruction of temples in
Macedonia and Asia Minor—something that Cynegius, a Christian
fundamentalist, does it happily.

385-388
Maternus Cynegius, encouraged by his fanatical wife, and together
with Bishop St Marcellus, organises bands of Christian
‘paramilitary’ murderers who travel throughout the Eastern
Empire to preach the ‘good news’; that is, to destroy temples,
altars and reliquaries.

They destroy, among many others, the temple of Edessa, the
Kabeirion of Imbros, the temple of Zeus in Apamea, the temple of
Apollo in Didyma and all the temples of Palmyra. Thousands are
arrested and sent to the dungeons of Scythopolis, where they are
imprisoned, tortured and killed in subhuman conditions. And in
case any lover of antiquities or art comes up with restoring,
preserving or conserving the remains of the looted, destroyed or
closed temples, in 386 the emperor specifically prohibits the
practise!

Bust of Germanicus defaced by Christians,
who also engraved a cross on his forehead.

388
The emperor, in a Soviet-like measure, forbids talks on religious
subjects probably because Christianity cannot be sustained and
can even suffer serious losses through religious debates. Libanius,
the old orator of Constantinople once accused of magician, directs
to the emperor a desperate and humble epistle Pro Templis (‘In
Favour of the Temples’), trying to preserve the few remaining
temples. The emperor did not pay attention to him.

389-390
All non-Christian holidays are banned. The antifa of those times,
headed by hermits of the desert, invade the Roman cities of East
and North Africa. In Egypt, Asia Minor and Syria, these hordes
sweep away temples, statues, altars and libraries: killing anyone
who crosses their path. Theodosius I orders the devastation of the
sanctuary of Delphi, centre of wisdom respected throughout the
Hélade, destroying its temples and works of art.

Bishop Theophilus, patriarch of Alexandria, initiates persecutions
of the adepts of classical culture, inaugurating in Alexandria a
period of real battles on the streets. He converts the temple of the
god Dionysus into a church, destroys the temple of Zeus, burns the
Mithraic and profanes the cult images. The priests are humiliated
and mocked publicly before being stoned.

391
A new decree of Theodosius specifically prohibits looking at the
shattered statues! The persecutions in the whole empire are
renewed. In Alexandria, where the tensions were always very
common, the Hellenistic minority, headed by the philosopher
Olympius, carries out an anti-Christian revolt.

After bloody street fights with dagger and sword against crowds of
Christians who outnumber them greatly, the Hellenists entrench
themselves in the Serapeum, a fortified temple dedicated to the
god Serapis. After encircling—practically besieging—the building
the Christian mob, under the patriarch Theophilus, breaks into
the temple and murder all those present; desecrates the cult
images, plunders the property, burns down its famous library and
finally throws down all the construction.

It is the famous ‘second destruction’ of the Library of Alexandria,
jewel of ancient wisdom in absolutely every field, including
philosophy, mythology, medicine, Gnosticism, mathematics,
astronomy, architecture or geometry: a spiritual catastrophe for
the heritage of the West. A church was built on its remains.

392
The emperor forbids all ancient rituals, calling them gentilicia
superstitio, superstitions of the Gentiles.

The persecutions return. The mysteries of Samothrace are bloodily
closed and all their priests are killed. In Cyprus, the spiritual and
physical extermination is led by the bishops St Epiphanius—born
in Judea and raised in a Jewish environment, with Jewish blood
himself. The emperor gives carte blanche to St. Epiphanius in
Cyprus, stating that ‘those who do not obey Father Epiphanius
have no right to continue living on that island’. Thus emboldened,
the Christian eunuchs exterminate thousands of Hellenists and
destroy almost all the temples of Cyprus. The mysteries of the
local Aphrodite, based on the art of eroticism and with a long
tradition, are eradicated.

In this fateful year there are insurrections against the Church and
against the Roman Empire in Petra, Areopoli, Rafah, Gaza,
Baalbek and other eastern cities. But the Eastern-Christian
invasion is not going to stop at this point in its push towards the
heart of Europe.

393
The Olympic Games are banned, as well as the Pythia Games and
the Aktia Games. The Christians must have sensed that this Aryan
cult for ‘profane’ and ‘mundane’ sports of agility, health, beauty
and strength must logically belong to the Greco-Roman culture,
and that sport is an area where Christians of the time could never
reign. Taking advantage of the conjuncture, the Christians plunder
the temple of Olympia.

394
In this year all gymnasiums in Greece are shut down by force. Any
place where the slightest dissidence flourishes, or where
unchristian mentalities thrive, must be shut down. Christianity is
neither a friend of the muscles nor of athletics; or of triumphant
sweat: but of the tears of impotence and of terrifying tremors.

That same year, Theodosius removed the statue of Victory from
the Roman Senate. The war of the statues thus ended: a cultural
conflict that pitted Hellenist and Christian senators in the Senate,
removing and restoring the statue numerous times. The year 394
also saw the closing of the temple of Vesta, where the sacred
Roman fire burned.

395
Theodosius dies, being succeeded by Flavius Arcadius (reigned
between 395-408). This year, two new decrees reinvigorate the
persecution. Rufinus, eunuch and prime minister of Arcadius,
makes the Goths invade Greece knowing that, like good
barbarians, they will destroy, loot and kill. Among the cities
plundered by the Goths are Dion, Delphi, Megara, Corinth, Argos,
Nemea, Sparta, Messenia and Olympia. The Goths, already
Christianized in Arianism, kill many Greeks; set fire to the ancient
sanctuary of Eleusis and burn all its priests, including Hilary,
priest of Mithras.

The emperor Arcadius. At first glance an eunuch,
a brat, especially when compared to the Roman emperors

and soldiers of yore.

396
Another decree of the emperor proclaims that the previous culture
will be considered high treason. Most of the remaining priests are
locked in murky dungeons for the rest of their days.

397
The emperor literally orders to demolish all the remaining
temples.

398
During the Fourth Ecclesiastical Council of Carthage (North
Africa, now Tunisia) the study of Greco-Roman works is forbidden
to anyone, even the Christian bishops themselves.

399
The emperor Arcadius, once again, orders the demolition of the
remaining temples. At this point, most of them are in the deep
rural areas of the empire.

400
Bishop Nicetas destroys the Oracle of Dionysus and forcibly
baptizes all non-Christians in the area. By this final year of the
fourth century, a definite Christian hierarchy has already been
established which includes priests, bishops, archbishops of larger
cities and the patriarchs: the archbishops responsible for major
cities, namely Rome, Jerusalem, Alexandria and Constantinople.

To this image of a priestess of Ceres, the
Roman Demeter, goddess of agriculture and
grain, patiently carved on ivory around the
year 400 and of an unprecedented beauty, the
Christians mutilated her face and threw it
into a well in Montier-en-Der, a later abbey in
the northeast of France.

It is possible that the image was not thrown
into the pit because of hatred (the Christians
were more prone to directly destroy), but that
the owners got rid of her for fear that the
religious authorities would find it. Impossible
to know the amount of artistic
representations, even superior to this one in

beauty, that were destroyed, and of which nothing has remained.
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This site in a nutshell: here.
See also “The 14 words” and
“New tablets of stone”.

The Fair Race’s Darkest
Hour is a compilation of
texts by seventeen authors
that changed my world-
view. A softcover edition of
the book is available: here.

A translation of the work of
Karlheinz Deschner on the
criminal history of
Christianity is available:
here.

Thomas Goodrich’s
Hellstorm is the most
important book of the 21st
century.

Its subject-matter:
the Holocaust
perpetrated by the

Allied forces on the
Germans, civilians included
(here).
 

Here: an SS
pamphlet explaining
National Socialism.

How we are light-years
away from the secular, Neo-
Christian ethics of the Alt-
Right can be surmised in
“Darwin’s
exterminationism”.

Presently Siege is only
available as a PDF.

“1945 was the year of the
total inversion of Aryan
values into Christian
values.” —Joseph Walsh

“With the death of Adolf
Hitler in the close of the
2nd World War in 1945
Western civilization, as it
had existed and is still
perceived DIED once and for
all. The only thing that was
left now was a gene pool.”
—James Mason

“The fall of Stalingrad is the
finish of Europe. There was
a cataclysm. The core of it
all was Stalingrad. There
you can say it was finished
and well finished, the white
civilisation.” —L.F. Céline

To unplug yourself from the
Matrix you really need to
undemonize Adolf Hitler,
Heinrich Himmler, National
Socialism and the Third
Reich. Click here to hit ten
articles on vital info about
the Second World War that
the controlled media
concealed from you.
 

Gens alba conservanda est
(“The white race must be

preserved”)

 

Worldly gain at the expense
of the Volk is the main
cause of the ongoing
destruction of the white
race.

See “Revaluation of
values”: a
paraphrase from

Francis Parker’s Yockey’s
The Enemy of Europe.

Fortunately, the collapse of
the dollar that is coming
will mark the beginning of
the end of America’s
economic and cultural
hegemony over Europe.
 

 
“The sign of the times is
degeneracy. This term—
degeneracy—sums up all
that is happening to the
West.”
 
CONTACT:

cesartort (at) yahoo

 

“RACISM”:

On the origin of the
word “racist”

The word “racism”
from the Nietzschean
viewpoint

 

Two texts by Wm. Pierce:

1. Best article
on the Jewish
question

2. The West’s darkest
hour
 

See how using non-white
labor in the Ancient World
or capitalism in the
Modern World is the main
factor for white decline:

Who We Are
(abridged)

 

For a couple of articles on
Richard Wagner and LOTR
click on pics below:

 

The Jewish Problem
(Jewish authors):

Larry Auster’s
unpublished chapter

Excerpts of Esau’s Tears

 

The Jewish Problem
(non-Jewish authors):

Definition of anti-
Semitism

The Culture of Critique’s
Preface

 

 

History of Jewry:

The saga of the European
Jews

Jew vs. White: More than
3,000 years of conflict

 

 

“Racism” is just an
expression of evolution.
All species go through
racial separation on their
path to speciation. No
exceptions.

In humans racist is just a
person who loves his
race, for example the
nymphs on this sidebar.
But in today’s mad West
the term “racist” de facto
means someone who
loves the white race to the
point of wanting to
preserve it.

 

Women from our
viewpoint:

The eternal feminine

On racial IQ studies:

The new enemies of
science

The roots of civilisation

 

Who am I?:

See an excerpted
translation from the
German Metapedia article
about me.

 

HUMAN SKIN COLORS:

ARCHIVES

Select Month

CATEGORIES

14 words

2001: A Space Odyssey
(movie)

Abortion

Abraham (patriarch)

Abraham Lincoln

Achilles

Adam Smith

Adolf Hitler

Adversus Christianos
(book)

Africa

Against the Fall of
Night (novel)

Agamemnon

Alaric

Albert Lindemann

Albert Schweitzer

Albert Speer

Albrecht Dürer

Alcibiades

Alcman

Aldous Huxley

Alex Linder

Alexander Alekhine

Alexander the Great

Alexandr Solzhenitsyn

Alexandria

Alexis de Tocqueville

Alfred Rosenberg

Alice Miller

Alt-Right / white
nationalism

American civil war

Americanism

Amerinds

Ammianus Marcellinus

An Eye for an Eye
(book)

Ancient Greece

Ancient Rome

Anders Breivik

Andrew Anglin

Andrew Hamilton

Andrew Joyce

Angela Merkel

Anti-German
exterminationism

Anti-white
exterminationism

Antichrist (book)

Antiochus IV
Epiphanes

Aphrodite

Apollo

Apollonius of Rhodes

Arcadia

Arcadius

Archeology

Archimedes

Architecture

Argentina

Arianism

Aristocracy

Aristophanes

Aristotle

Art

Artemis

Arthur C. Clarke

Arthur de Gobineau

Arthur Kemp

Arthur Schopenhauer

Artificial Intelligence
(movie)

Aryan beauty

Aryan problem /
Deranged altruism

Asia

Athanaric

Atheism and
secularism

Athena

Athens

Attila

Audios

Augustus

Australia

Austria

Autobiography

Axiology

Aztec people

¿Me Ayudarás? (book)

Barack Obama

Bartolomé de las Casas

Baruch Spinoza

Battle of Poitiers

Battle of Thermopylae

Bayreuth Festival

Beauty

Beethoven

Ben Klassen

Ben-Hur

Benito Mussolini

Benjamin Disraeli

Benjamin Franklin

Beowulf

Berlin

Bernal Díaz del Castillo

Bernardino de Sahagún

Bible

Bill Clinton

Biography

Blacks

Bob Whitaker

Book of Revelation

Brazil

Brenton Tarrant

Brigade (novel)

Brutus

Buddhism

Caligula

Camp of the Saints
(novel)

Canada

Cannibalism

Carl Gustav Jung

Carl Sagan

Carl Schmitt

Carlo Collodi

Carolyn Yeager

Carthaginians

Cassius Dio

Catholic Church

Catholic religious
orders

Cato

Celsus

Celts

Charlemagne

Charles Darwin

Charles Dickens

Charles Martel

Charles V

Chess

Child abuse

Childhood’s End
(novel)

China

Christian art

Christian question
(CQ)

Christian views on Hell

Christianity

Christopher Columbus

Cicero

City of God (book)

Civil war

Civilisation (TV series)

Claudius

Clement of Alexandria

Colin Ross

Color of crime

Committee for
Skeptical Inquiry

Commodus

Communism /
Bolshevism

Conservatism

Conspiracy theories

Constans

Constantine

Constantine II

Constantinople

Constantius II

Corneliu Zelea
Codreanu

Counter-Reformation

Crusades

Currency crash

Daniel (biblical figure)

Dante Alighieri

Darkening Age (book)

David (king of Israel)

David Duke

David Friedrich
Strauss

David Irving

David Lane

Day of Wrath (book)

Daybreak Publishing

Death in Venice
(movie)

Decius

Degeneracy

Degenerate art

Demeter

Democracy

Democritus

Demography

Denmark

Der Ring des
Nibelungen (opera)

Destruction of Greco-
Roman world

Diocletian

Dionysus

Dominique Venner

Don Quixote (book)

Donald Trump

Dorians

Dresden

Dwight D. Eisenhower

Dylann Roof

Eastern Orthodox
Church

Economy

Edmund Burke

Edward Gibbon

Edward I of England

Egalitarianism

Egypt

Eleusis

Elizabeth I

Emperor Julian

Energy / peak oil

England

Enlightenment

Enoch Powell

Erasmus

Esau's Tears (book)

Eschatology

Essay on the Inequality
of Human Races
(book)

Ethnic cleansing

Eugenics

Euripides

Europe

European Union

Eusebius

Evil

Evropa Soberana
(webzine)

Ezekiel

Fair Race’s Darkest
Hour (book)

Fascism

Feminism

Feminized western
males

Film

Final solution

First World War

France

Francis Galton

Francis Parker Yockey

Francisco Franco

Franco Zeffirelli

Frankfurt School

Franklin D. Roosevelt

Franks

Franz Boas

Frederick the Great

Free speech / Free
press

French Revolution

Friedrich Nietzsche

Friedrich Schiller

Fritigern

From Jesus to Hitler
(book)

G.W.F. Hegel

Galerius

Galileo Galilee

Game of Thrones

Gaul

Genetics

Genghis Khan

Genrikh Yagoda

Genuine spirituality

Geography

George Lincoln
Rockwell

George Orwell

George Washington

Germanic People

Germany

Giorgio de Chirico

Giselher Wirsing

God

Goethe

Gone with the Wind
(movie)

Gore Vidal

Goths

Gratian

Greg Johnson

Guillaume Faye

Gulag Archipelago
(book)

Gustave Doré

Hadrian

Hamlet (1948 film)

Hannibal

Hans F. K. Günther

Harold Covington

Harry S. Truman

Hate

Heinrich Himmler

Hellstorm (book)

Helmut Stellrecht

Henry VIII

Heracles

Hermann (Arminius)

Hermann Göring

Hermann Samuel
Reimarus

Hernán Cortés

Herod the Great

Herodotus

Hesiod

Hieronymus Bosch

Hippocrates

History

History of the decline
and fall of the Roman
Empire (book)

Hitler Youth

Hitler's table talk
(book)

Hojas Susurrantes
(book)

Holocaust

Holodomor

Homer

Homosexuality

Honorius (emperor)

Horace

Human sacrifice

Huns

Hunter (novel)

Hypatia of Alexandria

Ibycus

Iceland

Iliad (epic book)

Immanuel Kant

Immigration laws

Impeachment of Man
(book)

India

Individualism

Indo-European
heritage

Industrial Revolution

Infanticide

Inquisition

Intelligence quotient
(IQ)

Ireland

Isaac Newton

Isabella I of Castile

Isaiah (prophet)

Islam

Islamization of Europe

Israel

Italy

James Mason

James Watson

Jane Austen

Japan

Jared Taylor

Jean-Jacques
Rousseau

Jefferson Davis

Jeffrey Masson

Jeremy Bentham

Jerusalem

Jesus

Jewish hate groups

Jewish question (JQ)

Jewish–Roman wars

Jez Turner

Johannes Gutenberg

Johannes Kepler

John Calvin

John F. Kennedy

John Locke

John Milton

John Modrow

John of Patmos

John Stuart Mill

John the Evangelist

John Tyndall

José María Morelos

José Vasconcelos

Joseph Goebbels

Joseph Stalin

Josephus

Joshua

Jovian

Judaism

Julian (novel)

Julius Caesar

Julius Firmicus
Maternus

Justice

Justinian I

Juvenal

Karl Marx

Karl Popper

Karlheinz Deschner

Kenneth Clark

Kevin MacDonald

Kriminalgeschichte des
Christentums (books)

Ku Klux Klan

Lactantius

Latin America

Lawrence Auster

Leon Trotsky

Leonardo da Vinci

Leonidas

Libanius

Liberalism

Library of Alexandria

Literature

London

Lord of the Rings
(novel / film)

Lothrop Stoddard

Louis XIV of France

Louis-Ferdinand
Céline

Luke the Evangelist

Lycurgus

Maccabees

Madison Grant

Mainstream media

Manosphere

Manu Rodríguez
(blogger)

March of the Titans
(book)

Marcus Aurelius

Marcus Eli Ravage

Mark the Evangelist

Mark Twain

Mark Weber

Marriage

Martin Bormann

Martin Luther

Marxism

Materialism /
capitalism

Maternus Cynegius

Matt Koehl

Matthew the Evangelist

Matthias Grünewald

Maxfield Parrish

Maya civilization

Mein Kampf (book)

Men

Metaphysics of race /
sex

Mexico

Michael O'Meara

Michelangelo

Middle Ages

Middle East

Miguel Hidalgo y
Costilla

Militarism

Miscegenation

Miscellany

Moctezuma II

Monarchy

Mongols

Monocausalism

Montaigne

Montesquieu

Morgenthau Plan

Moscow

Moses (Hebrew
lawgiver)

Music

My pinacoteca

Name of the Rose
(novel)

Napoleon

National Socialism

Neanderthalism

Nero

New Spain

New Testament

New York

Newspeak

Niccolò Machiavelli

Nicolaus Copernicus

Non-white
immigration

Nordicism

Norman Rockwell

North America

Norway

Nuremberg

Obituaries

Occam's razor

Occidental Observer
(webzine)

Odysseus / Ulysses

Old Testament

Oliver Cromwell

On the Genealogy of
Morality (book)

On The Historicity of
Jesus (book)

Opera

Oracle of Delphi

Oratory

Origen

Oswald Mosley

Otto von Bismarck

Ottoman Empire

Ovid

Painting

Parapsychology

Paris

Parsifal (opera)

Parthenon

Passing of the Great
Race (book)

Patriarchy

Pedagogy

Pederasty

Percy Bysshe Shelley

Pericles

Persephone

Persia

Peter Schiff

Petronius

Philippe Rushton

Philo

Philosophy

Philosophy of history

Pindar

Plato

Pliny the Elder

Plutarch

Poetry

Poland

Polybius

Pompey

Pope Francis
(Francisco I)

Pope Gregory I

Pope Theophilus of
Alexandria

Porphyry of Tyre

Portugal

Pre-Columbian
America

Prehistory

Pride & Prejudice
(2005 movie)

Pro-white
exterminationism

Protestantism

Pseudoscience

Psychiatry

Psychoanalysis

Psychohistory

Psychology

Puritans

Quotable quotes

Racial studies

Rape of the Sabine
Women

Raphael

Real men

Recceswinth

Reconquista

Red terror

Reformation

Reinhard Heydrich

Religion

Rembrandt

Renaissance

René Descartes

Republic (Plato's book)

Revilo Oliver

Rhodesia

Richard Carrier

Richard Wagner

Richard Walther Darré

Rising Tide of Color
(book)

Robert Jay Mathews

Roger Devlin

Romanticism

Rome vs. Judea (book)

Romulus

Ronald Reagan

Russia

Russian Revolution

Sappho

Satyricon (novel)

Savitri Devi

Schizophrenia

Schutzstaffel (SS)

Science

Second World War

Seneca

Sense and Sensibility
(movie)

Sexual "liberation"

Siege (book)

Sigmund Freud

Silvano Arieti

Skepticism

Sleeping Beauty (1959
film)

Socrates

Solomon

Solon

South Africa

Soviet Union

Spain

Sparta (Lacedaemon)

Sponsor

St Ambrose

St Athanasius

St Augustine

St Cyril of Alexandria

St Francis

St Ignatius of Antioch

St Irenaeus

St Jerome

St John Chrysostom

St Paul

St Peter

St Thomas Aquinas

Stefan Zweig

Stilicho

Strabo

Struggle with the
Daimon (book)

Sturmabteilung (SA)

Suetonius

Summer, 1945 (book)

Sweden

Switzerland

Sword

Tacitus

Temple of Artemis

Temple of Jerusalem

Temple of Serapis

Tenochtitlan

Tertullian

Thebes

Theoderic the Great

Theodore Lidz

Theodoret

Theodosius I

Theodosius II

Theology

Third Reich

Thomas Cole

Thomas Goodrich

Thomas Hobbes

Thomas Jefferson

Thomas Szasz

Thucydides

Thus spoke
Zarathustra (book)

Tiberius

Titus

Tom Sunic

Trajan

Transvaluation of all
values

Trauma model of
mental disorders

Turin Shroud

Turner Diaries (novel)

Twilight of the idols
(book)

Two Hundred Years
Together (book)

Ukraine

Ulfilas

Uncategorized

Uncle Tom’s Cabin
(novel)

United Kingdom

United States

Universalism

Valens

Valentinian I

Valentinian II

Valentinian III

Valerian

Vercingetorix

Vespasian

Videos

Vienna

Vikings

Vincent van Gogh

Vladimir Lenin

Vladimir Putin

Vlassis Rassias

Voltaire

W.B. Yeats

Ward Kendall

WDH radio show

Welfare of animals

West's darkest hour

White-slave trade

Who We Are (book)

Wikipedia

Wilhelm Sieglin

Will Durant

William Blake

William James

William Pierce

William Shakespeare

Winston Churchill

Wolfgang Amadeus
Mozart

Women

Wuthering Heights
(novel)

Xenophon

Yearling (novel)

Zeus

Zosimus

Zweites Buch

The greatest of the
“conservative” thinkers,
Joseph de Maistre,
pointed out long ago that
the French Revolution led
the revolutionaries rather
than was led by them. For
he believed that certain
Providential forces rule
our lives. These forces he
saw in Christian terms,
but others, like
Heidegger, for instance,
saw them in terms of
Being, over which humans
have no control.

In either case, the force of
Providence or Being or
Destiny has a power that
has often made itself felt
in our history. For this
reason, I have little doubt
that Europeans will
eventually throw off the
Judeo-liberal system
programming their
destruction. I’m less
confident about we
Americans, given the
greater weakness of our
collective identity and
destiny. But nevertheless
even we might be saved
from ourselves by this
force—as long as we do
what is still in our power
to do.

—Michael O’Meara

BLOGROLL

The Occidental Observer
(scholarly site about the
Jewish Question).

Nazi Propaganda Guide
Page (not exactly a
National Socialist friendly
site but very informative
of primary NS sources).

The legacy of Wm. Pierce

David Irving’s Website

Jake F.’s NS Archive

 

IN SPANISH

La hora más oscura

 

From Guillaume Faye's
"Mars & Hephaestus": 

The twenty-first century will
be a century of iron and
storms. It will not resemble
those harmonious futures
predicted up to the 1970s.
It will not be the global
village prophesied by
Marshall MacLuhan in 1966,
or Bill Gates’ planetary
network, or Francis
Fukuyama’s end of history:
a liberal global civilization
directed by a universal
state. 

The Third Age of European
Civilization commences, in
a tragic acceleration of the
historical process, with the
Treaty of Versailles and end
of the civil war of 1914-18:
the catastrophic twentieth
century. Four generations
were enough to undo the
labor of more than forty.
Europe fell victim to its own
tragic Prometheanism, its
own opening to the world
and universalism, oblivious
of all ethnic solidarity. 

The Fourth Age of European
civilization begins today. It
will be the Age of rebirth or
perdition. The twenty-first
century will be for this
civilization, the fateful
century, the century of life
or death. 

Let us cultivate the
pessimistic optimism of
Nietzsche. “There is no
more order to conserve; it is
necessary to create a new
one.” Will the beginning of
the twenty-first century be
difficult? Are all the
indicators in the red? So
much the better. They
predicted the end of history
after the collapse of the
USSR? We wish to speed its
return: thunderous,
bellicose, and archaic. Islam
resumes its wars of
conquest. China and India
wish to become
superpowers. And so forth.
The twenty-first century will
be placed under the double
sign of Mars, the god of
war, and of Hephaestus, the
god who forges swords, the
master of technology and
the chthonic fires. This
century will be that of the
metamorphic rebirth of
Europe, like the Phoenix, or
of its disappearance as a
historical civilization and its
transformation into a
cosmopolitan and sterile
Luna Park. 

The beginning of twenty-
first century will be the
despairing midnight of the
world of which Hölderlin
spoke. But it is always
darkest before the dawn.
Let us prepare our children
for war. Let us educate our
youth, be it only a minority,
as a new aristocracy. 

Today we need more than
morality. We need
hypermorality, the
Nietzschean ethics of
difficult times. When one
defends one’s people, i.e.,
one’s own children, one
defends the essential. Then
one follows the rule of
Agamemnon and Leonidas
but also of Charles Martel:
what prevails is the law of
the sword, whose bronze or
steel reflects the glare of
the sun. 

T A G S:

4 words

 

For Spanish-speakers: an
autobiography of the
editor of this site in two
volumes is available: here
and here. 

 

He who has not read Day
of Wrath has not looked
at the admin of this site in
the eyes. A hard copy is
available: here. For an
introduction see: here.

______  ______

“Hate is not some useless
organ like the appendix.
It’s there for a reason.

Why does Christianity do
all it can to talk us out of
necessary and functional
drives?

Well, the answer is that
it’s a bit of software
meant to disable our
enemy recognition
module. Christianity
preaches blind love, and
that love is murdering the
West”. – Alex Linder

 

“Why were you so
ungrateful to our gods as
to desert them for the
Jews?” —Emperor Julian to
the Christians

Regarding the sticky
post see esp. post #37.
For the context of the
Christian problem see:
here.
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When you forbid your
enemy to hate, you’ve
disarmed him.
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